IFB 090324LP - Windows Computers, Laptops, Tablets and Charging Carts
(Bid Tabulation)

Arey Jones

Hypertec USA,

Thomas

Unistar-Sparco

Vendor Educational Solutions Catalytix CDW-G ER2 Inc Technologyx Cons:xr:Zants, e
HP Probook 440 Dell Latitude Microsoft Surface Laptop | Dell Latitude | CRIUS C0310- No Bid HP Probook [Lenovo K15 Gen3
Device #1 Student Laptop G11 3340 Go3 3450 G1-SC 440 G11 Intel
Device Cost $522.00 $928.32 $765.00 $515.50 $636.17 $543.51 $643.53
Initial Warranty $79.20 $418.28 $132.00 $118.01 Included $83.43 Included
Total (Device & Warranty)
without ADP $601.20 $1,346.60 $897.00 $633.51 $636.17 $626.94 $643.53
Device $522.00 $928.32 $765.00 $515.50 $636.17 $543.51 $643.53
Included in
Optional Warranty (ADP) $153.69 warranty $342.00 $180.84 $162.74 $76.00
Total Device w/ADP Warranty $675.69 $928.32 $1,107.00 $696.34 $636.17 $706.25 $719.53
Arey Jones ] Hypertec USA, Thomas Unistar-Sparco
Vendor . . Catalytix CDW-G ER2 Technologyx Consultants,
Educational Solutions Inc Inc Computers
Device #2 Teacher Admin HP Probook 440 Dell Latitude Microsoft Surface Laptop 6 Dell Latitude | CRIUS N340- No Bid HP Probook | Lenovo K14 Gen
Laptop G11 3450 3450 G1-SC 440 G11 3 Intel
Device Cost $568.05 $1,158.96 $1,190.00 $564.39 $645.08 $591.47 $669.54
Warranty $79.20 $306.24 $152.00 $116.24 Included $83.43 Included
Total (Device & Warranty) $647.25 $1,465.20 $1,342.00 $680.63 $645.08 $674.90 $669.54
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Arey Jones

Hypertec USA,

Thomas

Unistar-Sparco

Educational Solutions

Inc

Inc

Vendor Educational Solutions Catalytix cow-6 ER2 Inc Technologyx Cons:xr:Zants, Computers
Device #3 Super Admin HP Probook 440 Dell Latitude Microsoft Surface Lanton & Dell Latitude | CRIUS N310- No Bid HP Probook [ Lenovo K14 Gen
Laptop G11 3450 Ptop 3450 G1-SC 440 G11 3 Intel
Device Cost $699.50 $1,161.01 $1,450.00 $769.95 $801.44 $728.34 $890.98
Warranty $79.20 $418.28 $152.00 $135.81 Included $83.43 Included
Total (Device & Warranty) $778.70 $1,579.29 $1,602.00 $905.76 $801.44 $811.77 $890.98

Arey Jones Hypertec USA LIRS Unistar-Sparco
Vendor E Catalytix CDW-G ER2 e ! Technologyx Consultants, .

Computers

HP Zbook Fury 16

Mobile Precision

Microsoft Surface Laptop
Studio 2

Dell Precision

No Bid

No Bid

HP ZBook Fury

ThinkPad P1 G7

Device #4 -STEM/CAD Laptop G11 5490 7680 16 G11
Device Cost $1,724.25 $2,210.66 $2,400.00 $1,690.82 $1,795.38 $2,221.47
Warranty $153.69 $522.11 $218.00 $474.13 $162.74 Included
Total (Device & Warranty) $1,877.94 $2,732.77 $2,618.00 $2,164.95 $1,958.12 $2,221.47
Thomas )
Vendor Afey Jones . Catalytix CDW-G ER2 Hypertec USA, Technologyx Consultants, Unistar-Sparco
Educational Solutions Inc Inc Computers
. . . ThinkCentre
HP ProOne G9 OEET;ZZACIJO No Bid D(;IL;?X?(I;X ArluszljSSO- Non Responsive HIZZ(r)oGogne M90a GEnS5 Intel

Device #5 - AlO Desktop Q670
Device Cost $679.38 $1,614.52 $776.26 672.39 $707.36 $819.00
Warranty $22.63 $200.92 $94.51 Included $23.69 Included
Total (Device & Warranty) $702.01 $1,815.44 $870.77 672.39 $731.05 $819.00
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Thomas
Arey J Hypert A, istar-
Vendor Tey ones . Catalytix CDW-G ER2 ypertec US Technologyx Consultants, Unistar-Sparco
Educational Solutions Inc Inc Computers
Lenovo Flex HP Elite c640
HP Elite c640 G3 | CHRMBK 2130 2 No Bid 5 No Bid Nonh Responsive G3 Lenovo Flex5
Device #8 - CHROMEBOOK CHROMEBOOK in18GB P CHROMEBOO Chrome
. Chromebook
(Charter & Private) K
Device Cost $547.68 $573.46 $732.02 $574.48 $523.69
Warranty Included Included $0.00 Included Included
Total (Device & Warranty) S547.68 $573.06 $732.02 S$574.48 $523.69
$547.68 $573.46 $732.02 $574.48 $523.69
Arey Jones Hypertec USA Thomas Unistar-Sparco
Vendor . v . Catalytix CDW-G ER2 e ’ Technologyx Consultants, P
Educational Solutions Inc Inc Computers
Device #9 - 36 Unit Mobile Anywhere Cart PT- A here Anywhere
ywher No Bid Aver 36 for ipad nyw No Bid Non Responsive yw 36 Mobile Cart
Cart 36 Cart PT-36 Cart PT-36
Device/Cart Cost $555.50 $569.00 $641.18 $556.50 $848.16
Total (Device & Warranty) $555.50 $569.00 $641.18 $556.50 $848.16
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